
Sr. No. Description Quantity Unit Rate Amount

1 TABLES

1.01 TABLE SIZE: 6'-0" X 3'-0" X 2'-6" HT.  (AGMs Table) 2.00        NOS -                    

 Supplying and installation of Table as per the following description: Size 6'-0" x 3'-0.". Table
top shall be made from 18 mm thick commercial plywood with necessary support. Table top
shall be supported by 18 mm thick commercial ply wood with wooden framing. Drawer
Storage Unit- 1'-4" W x 2'-0" D shall be provided using 18 mm thick commercial ply wood
having 4 Nos drawers as directed with heavy duty telescope sliding channel of approved
make , grouplock, S.S. Handle. Computer Key board of metal of approved make shall be
provided. Exposed surfaces of the CABINET shall have laminate, All internal surface will
have 0.80 mm thick  balacing laminate. 

   

Apron (Modesty Panel) made from 18 mm thick ply wood finished with laminate as per
drawing

Table side made from 18 mm thick ply wood with 1.0 mm thick Laminate finish shall be
provided in a pattern as  per drawing.  Laminate  to be provided  on all visible surfaces. 

Readymade CPU trolly with caster and metalic cable Manager shall be provided in table. All
exposed edges of  teak wood shall have polished with  smooth edges & corners

All the internal surface (non visible surface) shall be provided with 0.80 mm thick balancing
laminate of approved shade. Etc. complete.

As per drawing and instruction  of Architect/Bank work to be Completed   

FINISHING DETAILS IN NUTSHELL:

1) Table Top : 18 mm thick commercial plywood with equal sized 10mm thick back painted
toughened glass

2) Front Appron & Sides:  1.0 mm thick  Dark Laminate 

3) Facing of Drawers: 1.0 mm thick  Dark Laminate 

4) All the internal surface (non visible surface) shall be provided with 0.80 mm thick
balancing laminate 

1.02 TABLE SIZE: 5'-0" X 2'-6" X 2'-6" HT. 12.00      NOS -                    

Same as above Item-no-1.02 but 4 Nos Drawer Unit with 1.0 mm thick Laminate finish on
all  exposed surfaces. (For Sales and Service)

1.03 LINEAR TABLE SIZE: 4'-0" X 2'-0" X 2'-6" HT. 4.87        RMT -                    

Providing and fixing Linear Table having width of 2'-0" using 18 mm thick Commercial
plywood for Top and verticle support at 4'-0" c/c, Providing storage cabinet 3 drawers at
Every 4'-0" c/c, Group lock, SS handle in counter as directed complete. 1.0 mm thick
Laminate finish on table Top and front side of shutter. Providing ready made Foot rest
CPU stand trally with castor and metalic cable Manager shall be provided in table top All
internal surfaces shall have 0.80 mm thick balacing laminate as directed. [FOR DETAIL
REFER DRG]  (For Assit.)

2 STORAGE

2.01 SIDE CREDENZA 9.80        SQ.MT -                    

PRICE BID FOR PROPOSED INTERIOR FURNISHING WORK (LOOSE & FIXED FURNITURE) FOR HLST IN OLD SBI ZONAL OFFICE AMBAWADI AT 
AHMEDABAD

Rate should be inclusive of material, labour, tools, machinery, scaffolding, final disposal of debris, cleaning cutting wastage etc. All taxes, transportation etc.
complete. (Excluding GST) GST  will be paid  as Applicable at the time of payment of Bills. 
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Supplying and providing side cabinet for keeping computer and printer size 1'-4" width 2'-6"
height and 3'-6"/3'-0" length. Openable shutter with 1.0mm thick laminate finish on Top,
front side shutter and 35 mm x 6mm thick Burma Teak beading on Top Edges with
melamine polish. Laminate to be provided only on visible surface etc complete as follows.
Having openable shutters as directed. Cabinet shall be made from 18mm thick commercial
ply wood with 1.0mm thick laminate Finish. back shall be made from 6mm th commercial
plywood. Openable shutters shall be made from 18mm thick commercial ply wood with
laminate finished and approved make group lock, S.S. handle, hinges, magnet catch. , Rate
includes all necessary provisions for installing computers. All internal surfaces shall have
0.80 mm thick balacing laminate as directed.

Exposed edges of Sides, Table Top shall be made 36 mm thick by providing additional 18
mm thick ply wood patta of required width. As per drawing and instruction of Architect/Bank
Complete
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FINISHING DETAILS IN NUTSHELL:

1)  Table Top :   Dark Laminate & Burma Teak beading on Edges with  polished

2) Front Appron & Sides:   Dark Laminate

2.02 BACK SIDE STORAGE CABINATE

Supplyling and providing storage cabinate with 1.0mm laminate on Top, Front Shutter &
35mm x 6mm thick Burma Teak beading on Edges with polish. Laminate to be provided
only on visible surfaces.

        8.60 SQMT -                    

Size : Depth 1'-4", 3'-0" ht. having openable shutter as directed. storage Cabinet shall be
made from 18mm thick commercial ply wood for Top with 1mm laminate finish and 18mm
thick ply wood for verticle, shelves, shutters and 6mm commercial plywood for backing with
1mm laminate on all exposed surface. with verticle (at 3'-0" c/c) shelves at 1'-3" c/c
Openable shutters in 18mm thick commercial ply wood with all S.S hinges, towers bolts, S.S.
handle, ball catches, S.S approved make (group lock) multi purpose lock complte. Edges to
be finished with teak wood lipping etc. Laminate to be provided only on over visible surface.
Front surface area shall be measured for payment purpose. All internal surfaces shall have
0.80 mm thick balacing laminate as directed.

FINISHING DETAILS IN NUTSHELL:

1)  Table Top :   Dark Laminate & Burma Teak beading on Edges with  pilished

2) Front Appron & Sides:   Dark Laminate

2.03 P/F ELECTRIC CUB BOARD 5.00        SQMT -                    

Providing and fixing Electric cup board using 18 mm thick Bison board for inside verticle
division, shelves and shutter. Aluminium framing of 50x25x1.20mm thick with 6 mm thick
Bison board on both side for outer partition with 1.0 mm thick laminate on all exposed
surface and polishing/ synthetic enamal paint on all internal surface. Shutter will have
approved make lock, handle, S.S. hinges, ball catches & S.S Perforated jali etc.complete as
directed. Depth of cup board will be around 1'-6". Height of shutter will be maximum 7'-0".
Only Front elevation shall be measured for payment purpose.

3 PARTITION WORK AND DOORS
3.01 LOW HEIGHT BOTH SIDE LAMINATE PARTITION WITH CLEAR FLOAT GLASS 33.60      SQMT -                    

Providing and fixing low height partition using 50mm x25mm x 1.50mm thick Aluminium
members maximum in grid of 2'-0" x 2'-0" fixing 12 mm thick MDF Board exterior grade / 6
mm thick ply of approved brand on both side of aluminium framing and fixing 1.0 mm thick
laminate of approved shade on both sides. Fixing 12mm thick free clear float glass with
machine cut eadge as directed. Applying lacquer polish on exposed steam beach members
/ edges as directed. Laminate to be provided only on visible surface Providing pinup board
of soft board covered with fabric and fixed in partition as per design/instruction complete as
directed. The rate should include cost of necessary hardware, making cutouts / openings for
electrical conduits / cables, Switch boards, etc., complete as per drawings and as directed by
the Engineer-in-charge at site. contractor shall make necessary cutout in panelling/partitions
/ wooden members to facilitate electrical/data cabelling and No extra amount shall be paid
for this.

3.02 BOTH SIDE LAMINATE PARTLY GLAZED / SOLID FULL HEIGHT PARTITION WITH
DOOR 18.50      SQMT -                    
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 Providing and fixing both sides laminate full height partly glazed partition using 50mm x
25mm x 1.50mm thick Aluminium members in a maximum grid of 2'-0" x 2'-0" fixing 12 mm
thick MDF Board exterior grade / 6 mm thick ply on both sides,1.0 mm laminate of
approved make shall be fixed on MDF / plywood. Providing and fixing 8 mm thick float glass
as directed in the partition. Including Providing and fixing door shutter using 32 mm thick
flush shutter both side laminated and fixing 8 mm thick glass with beading patti, 5" Long 3
Nos stainless steel hinges, door closer, doorstop shall be provided as directed. Godrej
Mortice lock shall be provided in door shutter. All visible members if not laminated shall have
lacquer polished as directed.[REFER DRG]
For purpose of payment partition height up to bottom of false ceilling only shall be
measured and paid. The rate should include cost of necessary hardware, making cutouts /
openings for electrical conduits / cables, Switch boards, AC ducts etc., including providing
necessary wooden/aluminum section members support at cutouts, doors/windows openings
etc. complete as per drawings and as directed by the Engineer-in-charge at site. No extra
payment shall be made for members going up to slab/beam bottom. contractor shall make
necessary cutout in panelling/partitions / wooden members to facilitate electrical/data
cabelling and  No extra amount shall be paid for this.

3.03 FULL HEIGHT FULLY GLAZED PARTITION WITH 12MM TOUGHENED GLASS 14.4 SQMT -                    

Providing & fixing full height glazed partition with 12mm Toughened glass of approved make
up to 7'-0"/8’-0" level height with solid partition above 7'-0"/8’-0” level up to false ceiling
bottom.
The glazed panels shall be fixed to the existing floor and false ceiling with all necessary SS
brackets (D, C or U type) Vertical joints between the glass panels shall be sealed with
suitable transparent sealant.

The solid partition above 7'-0"/8’-0” level shall be made with aluminium framework of size
50mm X 25mm X1.50mm box section. The spacing of the Horizontal and Vertical members
are approximately 600mm c/c (maximum) and the top of the frame shall be fixed to the RCC
slab bottom. The exposed surfaces on both sides of framework are covered with 6mm BWR
ply finished with 1.0mm thick laminate as per direction including 3M glass film of approved
design up to 4'0" height.

4 PANELLING WORK
4.01 PANELING WITH ALUMINIUM FRAMING (FINISH: LAMINATE) 39.20      SQMT -                    

Providing and laying panelling on walls & pillars having 12mm thick approved make BWR
plywood + 4mm MDF and 1.0mm thick laminate fixed on wall & pillars with 4mm x 4mm
groove pattern as per detail. Aluminium framing of 50mm x 25mm x 1.20mm thick at
maximum 2'-0" c/c bothways on wall and pillar etc complete as directed. The rate should
include cost of necessary hardware, making cutouts / openings for electrical conduits /
cables, Switch boards, AC ducts etc., including providing necessary wooden/aluminum
section members support at cutouts, etc. complete as per drawings and as directed by the
Engineer-in-charge at site. panelling as per design and instruction of Architect. contractor
shall make necessary cutout in panelling/partitions / wooden members to facilitate
electrical/data cabelling and  No extra amount shall be paid for this.

5 DOORS

5.01 FULLY GLAZED DOOR -  - Size 900mm x 2100mm 7.60        SQMT -                    

Providing and fixing in position frameless glass door shutter made using 12mm thick
toughened glass fixed to the partition (glazed / solid / gypsum partitions) using heavy duty
floor spring with pivot of approved make including necessary cutting of floor and making the
surface good to its original position including all necessary Patch fittings of approved make
and fixtures & hardwares.
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Approved make: DORMA Top Pivot - PT 24, Top Patch Fittings - PT 20, Bottom Patch
fittings - PT 10, Floor Spring - BTS 75 V, Corner lock with strike plate and Handle - TG
DIH600 - 600mm length) or equivalent brand fittings from Hettich / Hafele / as per sample
approved by the Bank. Rate should also include providing 3M Glass Film as per design/
instructions of Bank.

Mode of Measurement: Door opening size shall be measured.

6 ROLLER BLINDS       29.70 SQMT -                    

Supplying and fixing Roller Blind Blackout of approved make with selected fabric of
approved design and shed. (Basic Price of  Rs 135=00 Per Sq.Ft)

7 GRID FALSE CEILING     136.20 SQMT -                    

Providing and Fixing of Amstrong Mineral Fibre Acoustical Suspended ceilling system with
FINE FISSURED (MICRO LOCK) EDGE TILES With Armstrong Silhouette Exposed Grid.

Using Silhouette Grid with Fine Fissured microlook Edge Tiles. With necessary Angles at
junctions as per company specifications as directed complete. Rate includes necessary cut
outs for A/C Grills, diffusers light fixtures complete as directed. Cutout for light and Diffusers
will be deducted from area. Only Tiles cost will be ducducted for payment purpose. Item
includes Removing of Existing false ceiling with frame, sheet etc.and disposal of unservicible
material behind the Municipal limit.

After completion of work, certificate from Company to be obtained and submitted with bill
that work is  carried out as per their  specifications.

8 GYPSUM BOARD FALSE CEILLING       57.40 SQMT -                    

Providing and fixing Gypsum board 12.50 mm thick false ceiling in steps and design using
Original Indian Gypsum board with original GI sheet section of Gypsteel ULTRA/Serra (
Gypsteel Ultra/Serra shall be used) supporting system in line and level. Finishing the
surface and applying 3 coats of Plastic emulsion paint as directed complete. Entire work to
be done as per standard specifications of Saint Gobin Gyproc India. Item includes cove
pattern as per detail drawings and as directed by Architect/Bank's Engineer.

After completion of work to certificate from Saint Gobin Gyproc Company shall be
submitted along with bill stating that work is satisfactorily completed as per their
specification 
Note : (1) Rate includes making necessary cutouts for lighting fixtures (2) Pattas of Less than
1'-0" shall be measured in Sqft and not in Rft and paid in Sqft. (3) Only finished visible
surface area shall be measured for payment.

TOTAL COST OF FURNITURE WORK Rs. -                    

GST will be extra as applicable
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